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Wood ants play an ecologically dominant and conspicuous role in temperate boreal forests, making a
keystone contribution to woodland ecosystem functions and processes. Wood ant taxonomy and global
distributions set the scene for this text's exploration of wood ants as social insects, examining their flexible
social structures, genetics, population ecology, and behaviour, from nest-mate recognition to task allocation.
Wood ants' interactions with their environment and with other organisms are essential to their success:
competition, predation and mutualism are described and analysed. Bringing together the expertise of
ecological researchers and conservation practitioners, this book provides practical and theoretical advice
about sampling and monitoring these insects, and outlines the requirements for effective conservation. This
is an indispensable resource for wood ant researchers, entomologists, conservationists and ecological
consultants, as well as anyone interested in social insects, keystone species and the management and
conservation of forest ecosystems.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Guinn:

As people who live in often the modest era should be revise about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you is you
don't know what one you should start with. This Wood Ant Ecology and Conservation (Ecology,
Biodiversity and Conservation) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this
book serves what you want and want in this era.

Janet Baltimore:

The experience that you get from Wood Ant Ecology and Conservation (Ecology, Biodiversity and
Conservation) could be the more deep you rooting the information that hide into the words the more you get
serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but Wood Ant Ecology and
Conservation (Ecology, Biodiversity and Conservation) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer
conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by means of anyone who read it because the
author of this publication is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your current vocabulary
increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We advise you for having this specific Wood Ant Ecology and Conservation (Ecology,
Biodiversity and Conservation) instantly.

Wayne Robinson:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the ability
about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young ones,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their ability
in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write with their book. One of them is this Wood
Ant Ecology and Conservation (Ecology, Biodiversity and Conservation).

Chelsie Salls:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Wood Ant Ecology and Conservation
(Ecology, Biodiversity and Conservation) can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You
are consequently out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not
a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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